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Attachment A – Scope of Work 
 
Contractual Components for Urban and Community Forestry Program Success Stories 
US Southern Region c/o Texas A&M Forest Service 
FY 2023 
 

Deliverables: 
Article (packages) and Project Award Descriptions  
 
Articles (15) (article package) 

• Share stories about the opportunities, processes, and vision. 
• Capture, write, and share success stories about existing projects 
• Capture, write, and share success stories emerging from funded projects, demonstrating 

the diversity of projects and degrees of success. 
o Work supported by this funding in: 

 Southern Region state projects in urban forestry and other cooperative 
forestry programs 

  IRA, NOFO projects and technical assistance 
 other related services 

o Formats and information needed  
 Full article: 500 – 1,000 words 
 Summary article: 225 words 
 Social media posts 

• Facebook and Instagram:  ~10 – 100 words 
• X (Twitter): 280 characters 

 Geospatial information and other information for use in story maps 
• Graphic and imagery direction on project articles 
• Goals for articles include: 

o Show accountability to disadvantaged urban communities 
o Show forging of partnerships 
o show accountability for public funds 
o verify that we are using resources to make a positive difference in communities 

and people’s lives 
o share successes so others can learn from our results 
o spread the word about U&CF and other coop forestry programs as a valuable 

resource 
o show that numbers alone don’t tell the whole story of U&CF 
o reflect and learn from our work 
o practice good scholarship 

 
Descriptions (Write 12, Edit 40) 

• State award descriptions – to include pass-through and sub-award grants and projects 
• Direct award project descriptions  
• Up to 250 words  
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Attachment B – Payment Schedule 

 

Science Writer Pay Schedule by Deliverable: 
15 article packages  @$800 each 
52 project descriptions @$150 each  
 
Federal Fiscal Year October 1 – September 30 
FFY 2024 
 12 original project descriptions, edit 40 existing project descriptions  
 1 article package 
FFY 2025 

1 article package per month for 12 article packages total for the year 
FFY 2026 

1 article package per month for 2 article packages total for the year 
 
Payable upon deliverable completed by invoice.  



From: Smith, Terry
To: Moon, Linda
Cc: Lull, Travis
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
Date: Thursday, April 3, 2025 8:21:11 AM
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Thanks for sending this.  I talked to Travis this morning.  He said he checked the cooperatives
for existing contracts and didn’t find any.  He then attempted to find vendors on the
Comptroller’s bidders list and found that none were listed who perform this service.
 
We are in compliance with HUB since there are none from which to solicit, and he did attempt
to perform a procurement process.  So here are my suggested next steps:
 

Go ahead and complete your selection process and let us know who you want to
contract with.
Send us the statement of work and line items, making sure it doesn’t exceed 25k.
Complete the Employee/Independent Contractor checklist.
Enter a requisition into FAMIS.
We will issue a PO without performing additional steps.  This project has dragged on long
enough.  We will document the file with Travis’ statements that he attempted to perform
a bid but couldn’t find any vendors, then you were able to locate an individual through
networking who can perform the work.  I will include a note that the purchase represents
best value to the agency.

 
 

 
Terry Smith
Purchasing Department Head
Texas A&M Forest Service
200 Technology Way, Suite 1151
College Station, TX 77845
P: 979-458-7381

 
 
From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, April 2, 2025 4:44 PM
To: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: FW: Science Writer grant
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From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 10:14 AM
To: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

OK. Come on by at 10:30 a.m.
Thank you.
 
From: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 10:12 AM
To: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Either now, or this afternoon, whichever is better for you.  I am unavailable the next two days.
 
 
From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 8:47 AM
To: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

When can you come by my office today?
 
From: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Tuesday, November 5, 2024 5:22 PM
To: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Linda,
 
This is not ready to go.  We need to discuss further in person.
 
Travis
 
From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Monday, November 4, 2024 9:28 AM
To: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Hi Travis,
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Where are we with this project? Can this be deployed this week?
 
Thank you,
 
Linda
 
From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 3:26 PM
To: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

I think this is a good start. Thank you for the research into this for me.
 
I would also send the opening to the Southern Group pf State Foresters Urban and Community
Forestry Committee and to the Region 8 representative for Urban. They have contacts with
whom they have worked before and similar groups as you have listed.
 
What do you need from me?
 
What is the official document you will use to contact all of these entities? And can I have that
to send to the additional contacts I just listed above?
 
Linda
 
From: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Friday, July 19, 2024 10:38 AM
To: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Linda,
 
I have been looking into this in between other urgent requisitions (seeming everybody suddenly has
$20,000+ that they need to spend by the end of the fiscal year or an immediate need to repair
something), and I’m not having much luck figuring out how to post this publicly.  I found NIGP
procurement commodity code 961-90 for “Writing Services, All kinds, Including Resumes,
Calligraphers, and Engrosser Services,” but every listing in that category that I find on the state site
that is similar to what we are looking for had no award, which likely means no bids.
 
I found several listings on Indeed.com that sound like needs similar to ours, and that would make
sense.  Treat it like hiring a person, only for a contracted service.  I checked with Alicia in ED, and she
says that we can post on Indeed and LinkedIn without their involvement, as long as we make it
abundantly clear that this is a contracted job and not a hired position.
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Other than that, there are some job boards out there for freelance writers, and I found an organization
called the Austin Texas Science Communicators that is a forum for science writers that might be able
to help us find someone.  There is a master’s degree program at A&M in Science and Technology
Journalism that could help us find a current or former student that could write for us.  We might even
be able to call it an internship. 
 
The Science and Technology Journalism website led me a website for the Council of Science Editors,
which has a job posting page, as well: https://councilscienceeditors-jobs.careerwebsite.com/.  It
also led me to the National Association of Science Writers at nasw.org, which also has a job posting
page.  Those both look like good bets.
 
Please let me know what you think.
 
Travis
 
 
From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 9, 2024 3:59 PM
To: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Sure thing!
 
Attached is a general description of what I am looking for.
 
It may be changing right now on one of the writing assignments – but I won’t know until later
this week. Since we did not hire someone already, the timeline for one of the deliverables is
looming very closely and we may need to pivot and find a different way to get one of these
things accomplished outside of this hire. If this happens, we will edit the requirements and
deliverables in the attached before the procurement process begins.
 
I am available a little tomorrow if you would like to discuss.
 
Thank you,
 
Linda
 
 
From: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 9, 2024 3:18 PM
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To: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Linda,
 
Terry wasn’t able to provide me with any useful information on what you are looking for.  Can you fill
me in, please?
 
Thanks,
Travis
 
From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 9, 2024 12:11 PM
To: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu>; Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Thank you both.
 
From: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 9, 2024 11:59 AM
To: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@tfs.tamu.edu>
Cc: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: FW: Science Writer grant
 

Travis, please help Linda with this.
 
From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 9, 2024 9:41 AM
To: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Hi Terry,
 
The writer we identified has turned down the job after all.
 
How would you like me to proceed in finding and hiring a new writer?
 
Thank you of your help,
 
Linda
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From: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Monday, June 3, 2024 9:05 AM
To: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Since we are contracting directly with an individual, the attached needs to be completed.  Please
return to me once completed.
 
From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 1:36 PM
To: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu>; Cupit, Becky <bcupit@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Sure thing.
I do not yet have a service agreement, but attached is the justification in case we sign one.
 
From: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2024 2:32 PM
To: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu>; Cupit, Becky <bcupit@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

I will need justification for using the vendor you selected.
 
From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2024 2:17 PM
To: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu>; Cupit, Becky <bcupit@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

I wasn’t part of it but they went through people and connections of scientific writers they have
worked with on similar projects.
 
From: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2024 2:03 PM
To: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu>; Cupit, Becky <bcupit@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

What USFS process?
 
From: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2024 2:01 PM
To: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu>; Cupit, Becky <bcupit@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
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This is pretty much a pass though for promoting and informing on this topic. The writer was
identified through the USFS process.
 
I checked with a few folks with experience in these kinds of agreements, before accepting this
addition to the CPG and was told it is acceptable.
 
Please advise.
 
Linda
 
From: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2024 1:54 PM
To: Cupit, Becky <bcupit@tfs.tamu.edu>
Cc: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: RE: Science Writer grant
 

Linda, this is an award to TFS so TFS’s procurement rules apply.  What vendor did you have in mind
and how were they selected?
 
From: Cupit, Becky <bcupit@tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2024 1:50 PM
To: Smith, Terry <tsmith@tfs.tamu.edu>
Cc: Moon, Linda <lmoon@tfs.tamu.edu>
Subject: Science Writer grant
 
Terry,
 
Per our discussion, please see attached. It sounds like this is what Linda is wanting to use.  It is part
of our CPG award 23-DG-11083148-001 account number 431323. There is $23,076.92 available for
direct expenses.
 
Thanks.
Becky
 
 

Becky Cupit
Grants Administrator III
Texas A&M Forest Service
Office: 979-458-6683|Fax: 979-458-6622
bcupit@tfs.tamu.edu
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