PURCHASE ORDER

VENDOR

TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
200 Technology Way, Suite 1120, College Station, TX 77845-3424; Phone 979-458-7380, FAX 979-458-7386

Purchase Order (Include this number on all
0. correspondence and packages)

I E ENGINEERING INCORPORATED

DBA METER MAINTENANCE &
CONTROLS INC

1963 ESSEX CT

REDLANDS, CA 92373-8008

ORDER.

ANY EXCEPTIONS TQ PRICING OR DESCRIPTION CONTAINED HEREIN MUST BE APPROVED
BY THE TEXAS A8M FOREST SEAVICE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT PRIOR TO SHIPPING.

VENDOR GUARANTEES
MERCHANDISE DELIVERED ON
THIS ORDER WILL MEET OR

P500180 EXCEED SPECIFICATIONS IN
THE BID INVITATION.
VENDOR ALL TERMS AND
CONDITIONS SET
13300729770 FORTH IN QUR BID
INVITATION BECOME

A PART OF THIS

Order Date
11/19/2024
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INVOICE TO:

TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE
FRP--ASSOCIATE DIRECTOR

200 TECHNQLOGY WAY, SUITE 1162
COLLEGE STATION TX 77845-3424

SHIP TO:

TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE
LA GRANGE OFFICE

700 SOUTH REYNOLDS

LA GRANGE TX 78945

FLEASE NOTE: [F YOUR INVOICE IS #0T ADDRAESSED AS INSTAUCTED

PAYMENT WILL BE DELAYED.

ltem Desacription

Quantity

Uom Unit Price Ext Price

USER REF: 000000-DM
L MicroMotion Meter for the Austin Tanker Base
Delivery to TFS office in La Grange, TX

kkkkdk NET 30 *dkvks

NOTE TO VENDOR:

"SHIP TO" ANWND "INVOICE TO" ADDRESSES MAY
DIFFER. FAILURE TO SUBMIT INVOICE TO PROPER
ADDRESS MAY RESULT IN DELAYED PAYMENT.

*kx 4%k ¥%IFB TERMS AND CONDITIONS® %k % k% &k k%
ALL SPECIFICATIONS, PRICES, TERMS AND
CONDITIONS AS PER INVITATION FOR BID AS
REFERENCED HEREIN.
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ADDITIONAL QUANTITY AUTHORIZED AT SAME COST
QUOTED ON IFB-24-014 PER EMAIL FROM TERRY
DAVIS ON 11-12-2024. IFE TERMS AND CONDITIONS|
SHALL APPLY,

VENDOR QUOTE: IFB-24-014
VENDOR REF: TERRY DAVIS 909-307-2295

RTL

1| EA

37,245.000

TOTAL

Texas A&M Forest Service cannol accept collect freight shipments.

FOB: DESTINATION FRT PREPAID AND ADD

Terms:

FAILURE TO DELIVER - IF the vandor fails to delivar thesa supplies by the promised delivery date ar & raascnabie lime therealtar, without
giving acceplable reasons lo: defay, or If supplies are refectad (of failure to mael specil the Stata the right 10 purch
specified supplias elsewhera, nnd chasge the Increasa In price and cost of handling, if any, to the vander. No substilutions nos
cancallations permitted withou! prior approval of Purchasing Department.

IN ACCORDANCE WITH YOUR BID, SUPPLIES/EQUIPMENT MUST BE PLAGED IN THE

DEPARTMENT AECEIVING ROOM BY

_ /1 ;/

‘Tha State of Taxas Is exempt from oll Fedoral Excise Taxes.

STATE AND CITY SALES TAX EXEMPTION CERTIFIGATE: Tha undersigned claims an exemplion from laxes under Texas Tax Gode,
Sactlon 151.309 {4}, lor purchese of tangla | proparty Inthis order, purchased from tor andfor
shippor listed ebove, as this proporty Is being secured for the exclusive use ol the Slate of Taxas.

Tha Terms and Gonditions ¢f the Stato of Texas shall pravail.

THIS ORDER IS NOT VALIWSTNEDWHCHASING AGENT

FURCHARING AGENTFOR  *

TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE

37,245.00

37,245.00



Lull, Travis
- .

From: terry@gommoci.com

Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2024 1:44 PM

To: Lull, Travis

Cc: todd@gommci.com

Subject: RE: [External] Texas A&M Forest Service IFB-24-014
Travis,

We will still honor the price of $37,245 including shipping charges for the system for you guys.

There was a cost increase on some items but we can live with it this time, maybe they should buy 2 or 3 systems before
the price goes up, just kidding.

Have a great day,
Regards,

Terry Davis

Meter Maintenance & Conlrols Ine.

The Experts in Flow Control & Automation

18683 Essex Court Redlands, Ca. 02373
{909 307-2285 fax (908-307-2305
VWL AT SLim

From: Lull, Travis <Travis.Lull@ifs.tamu.edu>

Sent: Monday, November 11, 2024 7:46 AM

To: terry@goemmci.com

Cc: todd@gommci.com

Subject: RE: [External] Texas A&M Forest Service IFB-24-014

Terry,

Almost a year ago, you bid $37,245 including shipping, on IFB-24-014 for a Micromotion Proportioning

System. QOur aviation team are looking to buy another one. Is that price still good? | completely understand if it
isn’t. If you have to quote me a higher price, | will need to post it for bid again to accept the higher quote. Not a big
deal.

Travis Lull, CTCD, CTCM, CPPB, EMT-B #, 19K <

Buyer, Texas A&M Forest Service | Finance & Administration

200 Technology Way, Suite 1151 | College Station, TX 77845-3824
Tel: (979) 458-7382 | Fax: (979) 458-7386



TEXAS A&M

‘ 4 FOREST SERVICE

From: terry@gommci.com <terry@gommci.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 16, 2024 4:47 PM

To: BIDS Purchasing <BIDS@tfs.tamu.edu>

Cc: todd@gommci.com

Subject: [External] Texas A&M Forest Service IFB-24-014

Mr. Travis Lull,
“MMCI” Meter Maintenance & Controls, Inc. is pleased to present our proposal for your consideration for IFB-24-014.

Attached Is the completed ESBD file, our formal quotation and our drawing of the mass last flow meter system that we
had provided to Texas A&M Forest Service the last time.

Thank you,

Terry Davis
President Sales & Service

i~

Meter Maintenance & Controls Inc.
The Experts in Flow Contro! & Aufomation

1963 Essex Count Redlands, Ca. 92874
{909) 307-2295 fax (309-307-2345
AW DTG, GOt



