
VENDOR 
PURCHASE ORDER 

TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE 
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 

Order Date 
09/04/2024 

Page 01 

200 Technology Way. Suite I 120, College Station, TX 77845-3424; Phone 979-458-7380 FAX 979-458-7386 

Purchase Order 
No. 

(Include this number on all 
correspondence and packages.) VENDOR GUARANTEES 

J---------------------'------j MERCHANDISE DELIVERED ON 

P500100 THIS ORDER WILL MEET OR 
EXCEED SPECIFICATIONS IN 
THE BID INVITATION. 

VENDOR ALL TERMS AND 
f--1-9_9_3_2_6_8_1_4_2_0 ______________ ---i CONDITIONS SET 

FORTH IN OUR BID 
NESH PLAZA l 3 0 0 LLC INVITATION BECOME 

1300 N SAM HOUSTON PKWY E APARTOFTHIS 

SUITE 14 5 ORDER. 

HOUSTON, TX 77032-2974 

ANY EXCEPTIONS TO PRICING OR DESCRIPTION CONTAINED HEREIN MUST BE APPROVED 
BY THE TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT EBlQB. TO SHIPPING. 

I 11em Description Quantity 

1 

USER REF: 000000-MT 

Houston Office lease 9/1/24-8/31/25 

***** NET 30 ***** 

NOTE TO VENDOR: 
11 SHIP TO 11 AND "INVOICE TO" ADDRESSES MAY 
DIFFER. FAILURE TO SUBMIT INVOICE TO PROPER 
ADDRESS MAY RESULT IN DELAYED PAYMENT. 

EXEMPT PURCHASE - TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE 
PURCHASING PROCEDURES, SECTION 6 (EXEMPT 
PURCHASES) . 

EXEMPT AS LEASE OF OFFICE SPACE 

REFERENCE: OGC 2018-0048855 
LEASE TERM: 1/1/24- 12/31/28 

PREVIOUS PO# P400174 & P400382 
PHONE: 832-243-6213 

Texas A&M Forest Service cannot accept collect freight shipments. 

NOT SPECIFIED 
FOB: 

FAILURE TO DELIVER - If the vendor fails to deliver tt!ese supplies by the promised delivery date or a reasonable time thereafter. without 
gIvIng acceptable reasons fur delay, or 11 supplies are rejected fur failure to meet spec1f1cat1ons, the State reserves the nght to p~rchase 
specified supplies elsewhere. and charge the increase in pnce and oost of handling, H any, to the vendor. No substitutions nor 
canc~lations permitted without prior approval ot Pwchasi~g Department. 

The State of Texas Is e•empt from all Federal Excise Taxes. 

STATE AND CITY SALES TAX EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE:The undersigned claims an exempHon from taxes under Texas Tax Code, 
Section 151.309 (4), for purchase of tangible personal prcperty described in this numbered order, purchased from contraclor and1or 
sh1ppe1 I.sled above, as this property is being secured tor the exclusive use o1 the State of Texas. 

n,,. TPrm~ ~nrl Cnnr11t10<1s of the Stale otTexas shall ornsa<I 

12 

INVOICE TO: 

TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE 
FRD/SF--ASSOCIATE DIRECTOR 
200 TECHNOLOGY WAY, SUITE 1281 
COLLEGE STATION TX 77845-3424 

SHIP TO: 
TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE 
HOUSTON OFFICE-MITI/PREVENTION 
1300 N. SAM HOUSTON PKWY EAST 
SUITE 240 
HOUSTON TX 77032 

PLEASE NOTE: IF YOUR INVOICE IS NOT ADDRESSED AS INSTRUCTED 
PAYMENT WILL BE DELAYED. 

UOM 

EA 

Unit Price 

3,720.170 

TOTAL 

Terms: 

Ext Price 

44,642.04 

44,642.04 

I 

IN ACCORDANCE WITH YOUR BE), SUPPLIES/EQUIPMENT MUST BE PLACED IN THE 
DEPARTMENT RECEIVING ROOM BY 

THIS ORDER IS NOT VA 

PURCl-'ASING AGENT FOR 

TEXAS A&M FOREST SERVICE 



( 

Smith. Terry 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 

King, Maggie <mking@tamus.edu> 
Monday, July 1, 20241:40 PM 
Smith, Terry 

Subject: RE: [External] Fw: New Building Owner-Update 

Spoke with legal and the email is only notice we need. You can proceed in paying the new LL. 

Thank you, 

Magle King Real Estate Specialist 
System Real Estate Office 
979-458-6593 
mking@tamus.edu 

T HI~ TEXAS A&M UNIVERSITY SYSTEM 

From: Smith, Terry <tsmith@>tfs.tamu.edu> 
Sent: Monday, July 1, 2024 1:37 PM 
To: King, Maggie <mking@ltamus.edu> 
Subject: FW: [External) Fw: New Building Owner-Update 

Are yell preparing an amendment, or is there anything I need to do? 

From: NESH Plaza <officeadmin@ne·.hplaza.com> 
Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 11:37 AM 
To: King, Maggie <mklng@tamus.edu> 
Cc: Smith, Terry <tsm,th@tfs.tamu edu> 
Subject: (External} Fw: New Building Owner-Update 

Hello Maggie, below Is the email that was sent out to the Tenants advising of the change of ownership. 
I also included the W-9 that Jullie Hollar had requested and was emailed to her a couple of days ago. 

Kindest Regards, 

NESH PLAZA GROUP 
Yeime A. / Office Adm in. 
1300 N. Sam Houston Pkwy E. Suite #145 
Houston, TX 77032 
Office# 832-243-6213 

From: Starwood Office Admin <officeadmin@starwoodgroyp.net> 
Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 11:28 AM 
To: NESH Plaza <officeadmin@neshplaza.com> 
Subject: FW: New Buildins Owner-Update 

l 



From: Starwood Office Admin 
Sent: Friday, June 14, 2024 8:07 AM 
To: genovevacolchado@hotmail.com 
Subject: New Building Owner-Update 

Hello, 
We are pleased to announce the purchase of this building from GVJ Investments as of June 7, 2024. 
The name of the new owner is NESH Plaza 1300 LLC, who are excited to be part of this ecosystem. 
We would like to take this opportunity to thank you for being part of the tenant family and look forward to 
meeting all of you. 
To do so, we are inviting you and your office team to a lunch, 
DATE: f .rlday June 21et, 2024 
TIME: 11:30am-12:30pm. 
PLACE: Lobby area 

We hope you can attend and if so, can you reply to this email with the number of attendees from your 
office. 

For the July and future rents, we have the option of paying through ACH, which is our preference, (info 
upon request) 
Or You can continue to pay with a business check payable to: NESH Plaza 1300 LLC. 

P.S. 
Yeime(office admin) New Email: officeadmin@neshplaza.com 
and Robert{ maintenance) will continue as part of the NESH Plaza team. 

Kindest Regards, 

NESH Plaza Group 
Yeime A./ Office Admin. 
1300 N. Sam Houston Pkwy E. Suite #145 
Houston, TX 77032 
Office# 832-243-6213 
EMAIL: Qfficeadmin@neslJ.plaza.com 

- -- - --~ -- -- -~ --~ 
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